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Description

When looking for stocks to hold in a TFSA, it’s important that investors consider whether a company
has staying power. For those that aren’t familiar with the term, it refers to a company’s ability to remain
a solid business over the years. This is important to consider, because it can tell investors how a
company could stack up against competitors, economic conditions, and so forth.

In this article, I’ll discuss three TSX stocks with unbelievable staying power. These three stocks could
be excellent buys for your TFSA.

Buy one of the Big Five banks

When looking for stocks with impressive staying power, investors should first consider the Big Five
Canadian banks. These companies have been in business for over a century, allowing them to
establish very formidable moats over time. In addition, the nature of Canada’s highly regulated banking
industry makes it even more difficult for smaller competitors to surpass these industry leaders. If I could
only invest in one Canadian bank, it would be Bank of Nova Scotia (TSX:BNS)(NYSE:BNS).

This company is the third-largest Canadian bank in terms of revenue, assets, and market cap. Since its
initial public offering (IPO), Bank of Nova Scotia stock has grown at a compound annual growth rate
(CAGR) of 9.5% (dividends excluded). When dividends are considered, this company’s returns jump to
more than 12%. Speaking of which, Bank of Nova Scotia has been paying shareholders a dividend
since July 1, 1833. Since then, the company has never missed a dividend payment, representing 189
years of continued dividend distributions.

Consider this railway company

Much like the Canadian banking industry, the railway industry within our country is highly concentrated.
As it stands, there are only two companies which operate a meaningful amount of track within the
country. Of those two companies, Canadian National Railway (TSX:CNR)(NYSE:CNI) is, by far, the
leader. It operates nearly 33,000 km of track which spans from British Columbia to Nova Scotia. That
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large reach has also helped Canadian National become one of the most recognizable brands in the
country.

Since its IPO, Canadian National stock has grown at a CAGR of about 17.5%. That greatly outpaces
both the rate of inflation and the broader market. Like Bank of Nova Scotia, Canadian National is also
a tremendous dividend stock. Listed as a Canadian Dividend Aristocrat, this company has managed to
increase its dividend in each of the past 26 years. In addition, Canadian National’s dividend is also
growing at an impressive rate. It has a five-year growth rate of 12.2%.

This telecom giant should be in your portfolio

Finally, investors should consider Telus (TSX:T)(NYSE:TU) stock for their TFSA. One of the three
large Canadian telecom companies, Telus operates the largest telecom network in the country. Its
coverage area accounts for 99% of the Canadian population. Because of its major presence within that
industry, and the firm grasp that the Big Three telecom giants have on the industry, I find it hard to
believe that Telus could one day become obsolete.

Since its IPO, Telus stock has grown at a CAGR of 5.1% (dividends excluded). Investors should note
that this company has a high dividend yield which would contribute to even greater returns if accounted
for in the stock price. As of this writing, Telus stock has a forward dividend yield of 4.47%. Another
Canadian Dividend Aristocrat, Telus has managed to increase its distribution in each of the past 18
years.
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